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Btate of West Virginia
geney Requeit for Quote
Chamicala

“p‘w:?& 'dgn s.‘ " ‘ - » o —— S N i ,.‘Ms».-..x.w..‘.,;..r ,.m..,-,,_-m,..:,.-ﬁ‘m.,-m:‘we-;;wm
o wor: _yiﬁal | Reason for Modification:
oc Dannnpnlon: Pipestam Resbit 5P Golf Coursa Chemicals | |
Proc Yypa: _ Agency Purchass Order
Date lasund — [Sollicitetion Closes  |8olicitation No Varsion
2210208 (20200224 1330 RREG 0310 DNR2100000055 7

PO SN Rt i e a2

BID RESF"ONSE;

DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOUKCES
PROPERTY & PROCUREMENT OFFICE

324 4TH AVE

SOUTHCHARLESTON  wy 253031208
us

VENDOR

&

Vendor Customer Gode: 000000178080
Vendor Name : Advanced Turf Soluticns, lig,
Address : 12955 Ford Drive

Streat

City:  Fishers .

State: Indiana Country :  United States
Principal Contact: Marshall Klay

Veridor Conlact Phone: 304-400-3786 Extenalon:

Zip: 46038

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
James H Adkins

(304) 568-9307

Jarmia.h.adkins@wv.giov

bATE  2/18/2021

indor - /[ _ AR IREAOR,
Signature X ARSIl 74/ o/ e 35-2152001
mfférssubjnet‘to all terms-and :oudﬂlbﬁiwmlmd in this sollcitation
Dite Printect:  Febs B, 2021 Pagn 1

FORM ID; WVLPRC-ARPA002 202008
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INVOICE TO SHIPTO EEE

DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES

PIPESTEM STATE PARK PIPESTEM STATE PARK

RR 20 BOX 150 | _ 3405 PIPESTEM DR

_PIPESTEM WV 25875-0150 PIPESTEM wv 25978-0150

us us

Line,  Comm Ln Dasc Qty Unit lssue Unit Price Total Price

1 Bensumec 4LF pre-emergent herbicide or £.00000 UNIT 365.00 $2,190,00
aqual C

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

10171700 Pbi Gordon

Extended Description:

ltem Mo, 3.1 ,

Bensumet 4LF pre-emergent herbicide or equal.

1 unit is = or > 2.5 gallon

INVOICETO e SRR T

DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES

PIPESTEM STATE PARK PIPESTEM STATE PARK

RR 20 BOX 150 3405 PIPESTEM DR

PIPESTEM WV 25978.0150 PIPESTEM WV 264979-0150

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc _ Qty ‘ Uniit Issue Unlt Price Total Price

2 18-3-6 50% SRN+ Micros w/UMAXX Harrell's  84.00000 UNIT $33.00 $2,772.00
fertiizer of equal Alternate; ERNY'S 18-3-8 WAVICROS

Comm Code | Manufacturer Specification Model §

10171600 Andersons

Extended Description:

item No. 3.2

18-3-8 50% SRN+ Micros wiUMAXX Hairelfs fertilizer or equal.

1 unit is = or » 2.5 galion

Outs Printed:  Fob 8, 2027

Page 2 FORM 1D: WV-PRG-ARFO-002 2620/05
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INVOICETO e JSHIPTO 5
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES JIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES
PIPESTEM STATE PARK PIPESTEM STATE PARK
RR 20 BOX 150 3405 PIPESTEM DR
PIPESTEM WV 25976-0150 PIPESTEM WV 256790150
us us
Line  Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit lssue Unit Price Total Price
3 Roots 1-2-3 PreMix microbial fertilizer or equal 30,00000 uNIT 131.20 $3,836.00
Alternate: Foliar-Rak Calonise LTO
Comm Code Manufacturer Spetification Model #
10171600 ENF
Extended Description;
ltem No. 3.3 o
Roots 1-2-3 PreMix microbial fertiiizer or squal.
1 unitis = or > 2.6 gallon
INVOICETO = ASHIESO s e
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESQURGES DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES
PIPESTEM STATE PARK PIPESTEM STATE PARK
RR 20 BOX 150 3405 PIPESTEM DR _
PIPESTEM WV 25979.0150 PIPESTEM WV 260790150
us us
Line Conim Ln Desc Qty Unitissue Unit Price Totaf Price
4 Banner Maxx fungicide or equal 14.00000 LINIT $82.00 $1,148.00
Alternate: Armortech PPZ 143
Cornm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
10171702 United Turf Alliance
Extended Description:
ltem No, 3,4 ‘
Banner Maxx fungicide or equal.
1 unit is = or » 1 gallon
Dato Prinled:  Fen 8, 2021 Page 3 FORM 1D WY-PRE-ARFQ-002 2020705
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INVOICETO ~ © . 7 T ASHIPTO e
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES -DMSION OF NATURAL RESOURCES
PIPESTEM STATE PARK PIPESTEM STATE PARK
RR 20 BOX 150 3405 PIPESTEM DR
PIPESTEM WV 25978-0150 PIPESTEM WV 259790150
Us us
Line __Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit lssue Uriit Price Total Price
5 Primo Maxx plant growth regulator or squal  12.00000 UNIT 144.00 1,728.00
Alternate; Armortech PGR 113
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
10170000 United Turf Alliance
Extended Description:
ftem No. 3.5
Primo Maxx plant growth regulator or egual.
1 unitis = or>1 gaflon
INVOICE TO SHIPTO :
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES
PIPESTEM STATE PARK PIPESTEM STATE PARK
RR 20 BOX 150 , 3405 PIPESTEM DR
PIPESTEM WV 25978-0150 PIPESTEM Wv 259790150
us us
Line  CommLnDesc Qty Unlt Issue Unit Price Total Price
6 Primer Selact soil surfactant or equal 6.00000 uNIT 169.15 2,029.80
Alternate: Hydro-Psk Matador 2.5 Gal jug 12 units
Comm Cade Manufacturer Specification Model #
12161800 ENP
Extended Description:
ltem No. 3.6

Primer Sslect soil surfactant or equal,
1 uhitie = or » 5 gallon

Date Pristed:  Fab'8, 2021

Fage 4 FORM 10: Wy-PRC-AREQ-002 2023105
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INVOICETO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES DMSIQN OF NATURAL RESOURCES

PIPESTEM STATE PARK PIPESTEM STATE PARK

RR 20 BOX 150 3405 PIPESTEM DR

PIPESTEM WV 26979:0150 PIPESTEM WV 259790150

us us

Line  Comm L Desc ) Unitissue  Unit Price Total Price
7 Chipio 266 lungicide or equal 30.00000 UNIT 149.00 4,470.00

Alternate. Armortech IP 238 _

Comm Code B vManuiacmrer Specification Model #

10171702 United Turf Alliance
Extended Description:

dtein No, 3.7

Chipco 26GT fungiclde o equal,

1 unitis = or > 2.5 gallon

Sl el i SHIPTO

DIMISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES

PIPESTEM STATE. PARK PIPESTEM STATE PARK

RR 20 BOX 150 3405 PIPESTEM DR .

PIPESTEM WV 25979-0150 PIPESTEM Wv 258790150

us us

Line  Coinm Ln Desc , Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
8 Subdue Maxx fungicide or equal 13.00000 UNIT 423,00 5.499.00

Alternate: Mefenoxam AQ

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

10174702 Contral Solutions.

Exténded Description:

ftem No. 3.8

Subthie Maxx fungicide or equal.

1 unit is = or > 1 gallon

Date Printed:  Feb.g, 2021

FORM 1D: WY/-PRC-ARFC.002 2020/05




© 02/20/2021 11:18 AM 13177321826

-» 13045582165

pg 8 of 18

DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES

PIPESTEM STATE PARK PIPESTEM STATE PARK

RR 20 BOX 180 3405 PIPESTEM DR

PIPESTEM WY 25¢79-0150 PIPESTEM WV 25879-0150

us us

Line  Comm Ln Dest Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

9 Fare 80WP specialty fungicide or equal 32:00000 UNIT 51.00 408.00

8 Units (4x1.5LB)

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model ¥

10171702 Cortava

Extended Description:

itern No, 3.9 S ‘

Fore BOWP spécialty fungicide of equal.

1 unitis = or » 1.5 pound.

INVOICETO _ o SHIPRG T e

DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES

PIPESTEM STATE PARK PIPESTEM STATE PARK

RR 20 BOX 150 3405 FIPEST;EM DR .

PIPESTEM WV 25978-0150 PIPESTEM WV 25979-0150

us us

Line  Comm Ln Des¢ Qty Unit lssue Unit Price Total Price

10 Trimmit 28¢ plant growth regulator or equal  4.00000 UNIT 205.00 820.00
Alternate: Armortech PAC 223

Comm Code _Manufacturer Specification Model #

10170000 United Turf Alliance

Extended Description:

ltem No. 3.10 ,

Trimmit 26C plant growth regulator or equal.

1 unit is = or > 1 galion

Dsto Printed:  Feb 8, 2081 Pago © FQRM 10: WV PRCARFG-002 2020/05
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INVOICETO SHIP TO .

DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES

PIPESTEM STATE PARK PIPESTEM STATE PARK

RR 20 80X 150 3405 PIPESTEM DR

PIPESTEM WV 259790150 PIPESTEM WV 25876.0150

us us

Line _ Comm Ln Desc | Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

11 18-3-18 Contec DG granule fertliizer or equal 75.00000 UNIT 54.40 4,080.00

“ £3% MUI5 SON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

10171800 Andersons

Extended Description:

item No. 3.11 . _

18-3-18 Conles DG granule ferlilizer or equal.

1 unit is = or > 40 pound

INVOICETO SR SHIPTO | : R

DIVISION OF NATLIRAL RESOURCES DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES

PIPESTEM STATE PARK PiPEST_EM STATE PARK

RR 20 BOX 150 3408 PIPESTEM DR

PIPESTEM WV 25978-0150 PIPESTEM WV 25979-0150

us us

Ling  Commn Ln Dese Gty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

12 ‘Acslepryn insecticide or squal 2.00000 UNIT 569.30 1,138.60
Alternate; Aloft GC SC

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

10191508 Arysta LifeScience

Extended Description:

llem No. 392 |
Acelepryn insecticide ot equal,
1 unit is = or > 0.5 gallon

Uate Printed:  Feb 8, 2021 Page 7

FORR 1D WV-PRC-ARF(L002 2020105
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INVOICE TO : - |SHIPTO i
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES DIVISION. OF NATURAL RESOURCES
PIPESTEM STATE PARK PIPESTEM STATE PARK
RR 20 BOX 150 3405 PIPESTEM DR ‘
PIPESTEM WV 25973-0150 PIPESTEM WV  25878-0150
us us
Line  Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
13 Dimension EC pre/post-emergant herbicide or 8,00000 UNIT 538.75 4,310.00
squal___Afternate; Dimension 2 EW
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
10171700 “Corteva
Extended Description:
lfem N, 3.13
Dimeansion EC prefpost-emergent herbicide or equal.,
1 unit is = or > 2.5 gallon
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES
PIPESTEM STATE PARK PIPESTEM STATE PARK
RR 20 BOX 150 3405 PIPESTEM DR
PIPESTEM WV 25978.0150 PIPESTEM WV 26879-0150
Us us
Line _ Comm Ln Desc | Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
14 Chipeo Signature systemic fungicide or equal  72.00000 UNIT 1,317.04 11,853.38
(Agency) 44L8
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Madel #
10171702 Bayer
Extended Description:
ltem No. 3.14
Chlpca Sighature systemic fungicide or equal.
1 unit is = or > 6.5 pound
Date Privted:  Fels 8, 2021 Page B FORNM 1D WV-BRC-ARFQ-002 2020165
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INVOICE TO. G = |SHIPTO e e

DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES

PIPESTEM STATE PARK PIPESTEM STATE PARK

RR 20 BOX 150 3405 PIPESTEM DR _

PIPESTEM WV 259780150 PIPESTEM WV 259790150

Us us

Line  Comm Ln Desc ' Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
15 Daconil Action flowable fungicide or equal  16.00000 UNIT No bid No bid
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Made #

10174702

Extended Description:

item No. 2.15

Daconil Action flowable fungicide or equal,

1 unitis = or > 2.5 gallon

INVOICETO ... =, SHIPTO

DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURGES DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES

PIPESTEM STATE PARK PIPESTEM STATE PARK

RR 20 BOX 150 3405 PIPESTEM DR

PIPESTEM WV 268790150 PIPESTEM WV 25979:0150

Line _ Comm Ln Desc Qty Unitissue Unit Price Total Price
16 Xzemplar funigicide or aqual (Agency) 3.00000 UNIT 1,400.04 4,227.12
Cofrim Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

10171702 BASF
Extendéd Description:
Item No. 3.16
Xzemplar fungicide or equal,

1 onitis = or » 114 4. ounces

Qate Printed:  Fab 8, 2021

Page 9 FORM ID: WV-PRO-ARPQ-002 2020105
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N ke SHIPTO
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES
PIPESTEM STATE PARK PIPESTEM.STATE PARK
RR 20 BOX 150 3405 PIPESTEM DR ‘
PIPESTEM WV 26979.0150 PIPESTEM WV 28978-0150
us us
Line  Comm Ln Desc Qty Uhit Issue Unit Price Total Price
17 ZeroTol 2,0 fungicide or equal 12.00000 UNIT No bid No bid
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
AMM702
Extended Description:
ltem No..3.17
ZetoTol 2.0 fungicide or equal.
1 unitis = or > 2.5 gaillon
INVOICETO ) _|SHIPTO
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES
1PIPESTEM STATE PARK PIPESTEM STATE PARK
RR 20 BOX 150 3405 PIPESTEM DR
PIPESTEM WV 25979-0150 PIPESTEM WV 250790150
us us
Line  Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
18 Bifen IfT insecticide/iermiticide or equal 3.00000 UNIT 58.00 174.00
Alternate; Talstar-Select
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
10191509 FMC
Extended Description:
Jtem No. 3,18
Bifen IT insecticide/termiticide or equal.
1 unitis = ar > 1 gallon
Uste Printed:  Fab &, 2021 Pegin 10 FORM (05 WY.PRC-ARF-002 2020/05
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INVOIGERD

DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES

PIPESTEM STATE PARK PIPESTEM STATE PARK

RR 20 BOX 150 3405 PIPESTEM DR

PIPESTEM WV 259790150 PIPESTEM WV 268780150

us us

Line  Comm Ln Desc Qy Unit Issue Unit Price Yotal Price

19 Anti-Foain defoaming agent or equal 15,00000 UNIT 15.74 236.10
Alternate: Knockdown

Comm Code Manufacturer $pecification Model #

12161901 Precision Labs

Extended Duscription;

ltem No, 3.19 ,

Anti-Foam defoaiming agent or equal.

1 unitis = or > 1 quart

INVOIGETO. e e _|SHPTO. s

DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES BIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES

PIRESTEM STATE PARK PIPESTEM STATE PARK

RR 20 BOX 150 _ ’ 3405 PIPESTEM DR

PIPESTEM WV 26876-0150 PIPESTEM WV 268790150

us us

Line _Comm Ln Desc_ Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

20 Disarm C-fungicide or equal 9.00000 UNIT 449.00 4,041.00

Alternate. Fame C (Agency)

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Modél #

10171702 FMC

Extended Description:

lter No, 3.20 ‘

Disarm C fungicide or equal,

1 unit is = or 2.5 galion

Dato Printadl:  Pab & 2021

Page 11 FOAM (0 WV-PRC-ARFO-002:2020405
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INVOICE TO R, _ SHIPTO R

DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURGES

PIPESTEM STATE PARK PIPESTEM STATE PARK

RR 20 BOX 150 3405 PIPESTEM DR _
PIPESTEM WV 259790150 PIPESTEM WV 25979-0150

us us

Line  Comm Ln Dese Qty Unit lssue Unit Price- Total Price
21 Lontre! post-emergent herbicide or equal 400000 UNIT 162.00 648.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Modef #

10171700 Corteva

Exténded Description:

Htem No. 3.21 - ,

Lantrel post-emergent herbicide or equal,

1 unit is = or > 1 quart

INVOICE TO e {SHIPTOL. F., o x d o

,D!Vl,'SfION OF NATURAL RESOURCES DlVlSlO'N_I OF NATURAL RESOURCES

PlPES_',T,EM STATE PARK PIPESTEM STATE PARK

RR 20 BOX 150 3405 PIPESTEM DR

PIPESTEM Wy 26679.0150 PIPESTEM WV 26979-0150

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty ‘Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
22 Drive 75DF pre/post-emetgent herbicide or  18.00000 UNIT No bid No bid

equal ’ '

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Mode) #

10171700 Control Solutions
Extended Description:
Item No. 3.22

Drive 75DF pre/post-emargent herbicide or equal.

{ unitis = or > 1 potind

Date Printed:  Feb 8, 2021

Pege 12

FORM ID; WV-PRC-ARFQ:G02 2020105
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DIVISION OF NATURAL RESQURCES DIVISION OF NATURAL RESG’URCES

PIPESTEM STATE P,ARK PIPESTEM STATE PARK

RR 20 BOX 150 3405 PIPESTEM DR

PIPESTEM WV 25978-0140 PIPESTEM WV 25979-0150

us us

Line  Comm Ln Des¢ ' Qty Unlt Issus Unit Price Total Price

23 QuickSilver post-emergent herbicide or equal  11.00000 UNIT 162.00 1,782.00

Comm Gode Manufacturer Specification Modef #

10171700 FMC

Extended Description:

fem No. 3 23

QuickSilver post-amergem herbicide or squal.

1 uhit Is = or > 8 ourice

INVOICE 7O - : SHIPTO

DIVISION OF NATURAL Resouncr—:s DIVISION OF NATURAL Resauacss

PIPESTEM STATE PARK PIPESTEM STATE PARK

RR 20 BOX 150 _ 3405 PIPESTEM DR '

PIPESTEM WV 25979-0150 PIPESTEM WV 259790150

us us

Line  Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

24 Turt Trax spray pattern indicator or equal 87.00000 UNIT 27.00 2,348.00
Signal Blue Spray

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Niodel #

10170000 Precision Labs

Extended Description:

{tern No. 3,24

Turf Trax spray pattem indicator or equal,
1 unitis = or > 1 gallon

Uste Printed:  Feb 8§, 202

Page 12

FORM i0: WV-PRO-ARFQ-002 202005
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INVOICE TO N EL L
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES
PIPESTEM STATE PARK PIPESTEM STATE PARK
RR.20 BOX 150 3405 PIPESTEM DR
PIPESTEM WV 260790150 PIPESTEM W 269790150
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit lssue Unit Price Total Price
25 Heritage systemic fungicide or equal 4800000 UNIT No bid No bid
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model#
10171702
Extended Descnptwn'
liem No. 3,25
Heritage aystemic fungicide or equal,
1 unit is = or > 1 pound
INVOICE. T@ 1SHIPTO
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES QIVISION OF NATURAL RESGURCES
PIPESTEM STATE PARK PIPESTEM STATE PARK
RR 20 BOX 150 3405 PIPESTEM DR
PIPESTEM WV 258790150 PIPESTEM WV 25979.0150-
us us
Line  Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit lssue Unit Price Total Price
28 Segway Fungicids SC or equal 6.00000 UNIT 415.00 2,490.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
10171702 Pbi Gordon
Extended Description.
lteri No. 3.26
Segway Fungicide SC or equal,
1 unitis = of > 39.2 ounce
Oate Printed:  Fob 8, 2021 Pags 14 FORM 10 WV-PRG-ARFO:002 202005
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3336F systemic fungicide or equal.
1 unit is = or > 2.5 gallon

DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES

PIPESTEM STATE PARK PIPESTEM STATE PARK

RR 20 BOX 150 3405 PIPESTEM DR _

PIPESTEM WV 25978-0150 PIPESTEM WV 25979-0150

us us

Ling Comim Ln Desc Qty Unit lssue Unit Price Total Price

27 Chiorothalanit 720 Select fungicide or equal  16,00000 uNIT 106.60 1,705.60
Alternate: Armortech CLT 720

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

10171702 United Turf Alliance

Extended Description:

ltem No. 3.27

Chicrathalanil 720 Sefect fungicide or equal.

1 unit is = or > 2.5 gallon

INVOICE TD i . |SHIPTO e SO

DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES

PIPESTEM STATE PARK PIPESTEM STATE PARK

RR 20 BOX 150 _ 3405 PIFESTEM DR

PIPESTEM WV 25970-0150 PIPESTEM Wv  25879-0150

us us

Line Comm Ln Dese Qty Unit issue Unit Pr_ice To_tal,Price’

28 3336F systemic fungicide or equal 30.00000 UNIT 145,00 4,350,00

Alternate; Armortech 462

Comm Code Manufacturer Speclfication Model #

10171702 United Turf Alliance

Extended Description:

Item No, 3.28

1 Technical Question Deadline 9:00 a.m, ET

Date Printed:  Fab 6, 2021 Page 15

2021-02-17

FORM 10: WV-PRE-ARFQ002 2020/08
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Final

Chainicals.”

ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS

tiomal Terms and €

yiditions




